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QUESTION 1

You need to select the appropriate solution for monitoring the .NET application. 

What should you recommend? 

A. Visual Studio IntelliTrace 

B. Application Insights 

C. Data Factory 

D. Microsoft Analytics Platform 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 2

Background 

Overview 

Woodgrove Bank has 20 regional offices and operates 1,500 branch office locations. Each regional office hosts the
servers, infrastructure, and applications that support that region. 

Woodgrove Bank plans to move all of their on-premises resources to Azure, including virtual machine (VM)-based, line-
of-business workloads, and SQL databases. You are the owner of the Azure subscription that Woodgrove Bank is
using. 

Your team is using Git repositories hosted on GitHub for source control. 

Security 

Currently, Woodgrove Bank\\'s Computer Security Incident Response Team (CSIRT) has a problem investigating
security issues due to the lack of security intelligence integrated with their current incident response tools. This lack of
integration 

introduces a problem during the detection (too many false positives), assessment, and diagnose stages. You decide to
use Azure Security Center to help address this problem. Woodgrove Bank has several apps with regulates data such
as 

Personally Identifiable Information (PII) that require a higher level of security. All apps are currently secured by using an
on-premises Active Directory Domain Services (ADDS). The company depends on following mission-critical apps: 

WGBLoanMaster, WGBLeaseLeader, and WGBCreditCruncher apps. You plan to move each of these apps to Azure as
part of an app migration project. 

Apps 

The WGBLoanMaster app has been audited for transaction loss. Many transactions have been lost is processing and
monetary write-offs have cost the bank. The app runs on two VMs that include several public endpoints. 

The WGBLeaseLeader app has been audited for several data breaches. The app includes a SQL Server database and

Latest 70-534 Dumps | 70-534 PDF Dumps | 70-534 Braindumps                                2 / 8

https://www.pass4lead.com/70-534.html
https://www.pass4lead.com/70-534.html
https://www.pass4lead.com/70-534.html


https://www.pass4lead.com/70-534.html
2022 Latest pass4lead 70-534 PDF and VCE dumps Download

a web-based portal. The portal uses an ASP.NET Web API function to generate a monthly aggregate report from the 

database. 

The WGBCreditCruncher app runs on a VM and is load balanced at the network level. The app includes several
stateless components and must accommodate scaling of increased credit processing. The app runs on a nightly basis to
process 

credit transactions that are batched during the day. The app includes a web-based portal where customers can check
their credit information. A mobile version of the app allows users to upload check images. 

Business Requirements 

WGBLoanMaster app 

The app audit revealed a need for zero transaction loss. The business is losing money due to the app losing and not
processing loan information. In addition, transactions fail to process after running for a long time. The business has 

requested the aggregation processing to be scheduled for 01:00 to prevent system slowdown. WGBLeaseLeader app
The app should be secured to stop data breaches. If the data is breached, it must not be readable. The app is
continuing to see increased volume and the business does not want the issues presented in the WGBLoanMaster app.
Transaction 

loss is unacceptable, and although the lease monetary amounts are smaller than loans, they are still an important profit
center for Woodgrove Bank. The business would also like the monthly report to be automatically generated on the first
of 

the month. Currently, a user must log in to the portal and click a button to generate the report. 

WGBCreditCruncher app 

The web-based portal area of the app must allow users to sign in with their Facebook credentials. The bank would like
to allow this feature to enable more users to check their credit within the app. 

Woodgrove Bank needs to develop a new financial risk modeling feature that they can include in the
WGBCreditCruncher app. The financial risk modeling feature has not been developed due to costs associated with
processing, transforming, and analyzing the large volumes of data that are collected. You need to find a way to
implement parallel processing to ensure that the features run efficiently, reliably, and quickly. The feature must scale
based on computing demand to process the large volumes of data and output several financial risk models. 

Technical Requirements 

WGBLoanMaster app 

The app uses several compute-intensive tasks that create long-running requests to the system. The app is critical to the
business and must be scalable to increased loan processing demands. The VMs that run the app include a Windows 

Task Scheduler task that aggregates loan information from the app to send to a third party. This task runs a console app
on the VM. 

The app requires a messaging system to handle transaction processing. The messaging system must meet the
following requirements: 

You develop an Azure Resource Manager (ARM) template to deploy the VMs used to support the app. The template
must be deployed to a new resource group and you must validate your deployment settings before creating actual 

resources. 
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WGBLeaseLeader app 

The app must use Azure SQL Databases as a replacement to the current Microsoft SQL Server environment. The
monthly report must be automatically generated. 

The app requires a messaging system to handle transaction processing. The messaging system must meet the
following requirements: 

WGBCreditCruncher app 

The app must: 

Key security area 

You need to run the script for a new release. Which technology should you use? 

A. Azure WebJob 

B. Azure App Service API App 

C. Azure Function 

D. Azure App Service Logic App 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 3

You need to design the business continuity framework. Which technology should you use? 

A. Hyper-V Replica 

B. Azure Backup 

C. Azure Site Recovery 
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D. Azure StoreSimple 

Correct Answer: C 

Azure Site Recovery can protect Microsoft Hyper-V, VMware, and physical servers, and you can use Azure or your
secondary datacenter as your recovery site. 

From scenario: The company has a human resources (HR) application named HRApp that stores data in an on-
premises SQL Server database. The database must have at least two copies, but data to support backups and
business 

continuity must stay in Trey Research locations only. The data must remain on-premises and cannot be stored in the
cloud. 

References: https://azure.microsoft.com/en-us/services/site-recovery/ 

 

QUESTION 4

You need to deploy WGBLoanMaster app by using the Azure Command-line Interface (CLI). 

Which five commands should you run in sequence? To answer, move the appropriate actions from the list of actions to
the answer area and arrange them in the correct order. 

Select and Place: 

Correct Answer:  
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QUESTION 5

You are designing a plan to deploy a new application to Azure. 

The solution must provide a single sign-on experience for users. 

You need to recommend an authentication type. 

Which authentication type should you recommend? 

A. SAML credential tokens 

B. Azure managed access keys 

C. Windows Authentication 

D. MS-CHAP 

Correct Answer: A 

A Microsoft cloud service administrator who wants to provide their Azure Active Directory (AD) users with sign-on
validation can use a SAML 2.0 compliant SP-Lite profile based Identity Provider as their preferred Security Token
Service (STS) / identity provider. This is useful where the solution implementer already has a user directory and
password store on- premises that can be accessed using SAML 2.0. This existing user directory can be used for sign-on
to Office 365 and other Azure AD-secured resources. 
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References: https://msdn.microsoft.com/en-us/library/azure/dn641269.aspx?f=255andMSPPError=-2147217396 
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